Registered No. WB/SC-247 No. WB(Part-III)/2012/SAR-27

’,

FLS S

o
¥
]
]
b
N
¥,

S

Kolkata BGazette

Extraordinary
Published by Authority

SRAVANA 11] THURSDAY, AUGUST 2, 2012 [SAKA 1934

PART III—Act of the West Bengal Legislature.

GOVERNMENT OF WEST BENGAL
LAW DEPARTMENT

Legislative

NOTIFICATION

No. 1137-L.— 2nd August, 2012.—The following Act of the West Bengal Legislature, having been assented to by
the Governor, is hereby published for general information:—

West Bengal Act X VI of 2012

THE BENGAL EXCISE (AMENDMENT)
ACT, 2012.

[Passed by the West Bengal Legislature.]

[Assent of the Governor was first published in the Kolkata Gazette,
Extraordinary, of the 2nd August, 2012.]

An Act to amend the Bengal Excise Act, 1909.

WHEREAS it is expedient to amend the Bengal Excise Act, 1909, for the purposes {3;:“é ;\9059
. . = O o
and in the manner hereinafter appearing;

It is hereby enacted in the Sixty-third Year of the Republic of India, by the
Legislature of West Bengal, as follows:—

Short title and 1. (1) This Act may be called the Bengal Excise (Amendment) Act, 2012.

commencement.
(2) It shall come into force on such date as the State Government may, by
notification in the Official Gazette, specify.




[ParT III

2 THE KOLKATA GAZETTE, EXTRAORDINARY, AUGUST 2, 2012
The Bengal Excise (Amendment)
Act, 2012.
(Sections 2-12.)
;z’g‘:gg’;‘se‘gfgen_ 2. After clause (d) of sub-section (1) of section 15 of the Bengal Excise Act,
Act V of 1909. 1909 (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), the following clause shall be
inserted:—

“(e) regulate the manufacture, supply or storage of any intoxicant in the
distillery, breweries or warehouses, as the case may be, on.payment of
such fee in cash equivalent to cost of officers and establishment, and in
such manner, as may be prescribed.”.

Amendment of 3. In clause (e) of section 46 of the principal Act,—
section 46.

Amendment of
section 46A.

Insertion of new
section after
section 46A.

Amendment of
section 47.

Amendment of
section 48.

Amendment of
section 50.

Amendment of
section 51.

Amendment of
section 52.

Amendment of
section 53.

Amendment of
section 54.

(1) for the words “one year”, the words “three years” shall be substituted;

(2) for the words “one thousand rupees”, the words “ten thousand rupees”
shall be substituted.

4. In section 46A of the principal Act, in clause (i), for the words “two years”,
the words “three years” shall be substituted.

5. After section 46A of the principal Act, the following section shall be inserted:—

“Penalty for 46AA. Whosoever mixes or permits to mix with liquor or any
occurrence of . 5 oo . 5 G s -

death due to intoxicating drug any substance which is likely to cause disability or
ﬁg’;f)‘:fnpmn °of  death to human beings, shall be punishable with imprisonment for life,

or imprisonment of either of description for a term which may extend
to ten years and fine.”.

6. In section 47 of the principa1 Act, for the word, figures and letter “section
46A”, the words, figures and letters “sections 46A and 46AA” shall be substituted.

7. In section 48 of the principal Act, for the words “two years and to fine”, the
words “five years and fine” shall be substituted.

8. In section 50 of the principal Act,—
(1) for the words “one years”, the words “two years” shall be substituted;

(2) for the words “two thousand”, the words “three thousand” shall be
substituted.

9. In sub-section (1) of section 51 of the principal Act,—
(1) for the words “six months”, the words “two years” shall be substituted;
(2) for the words “two thousand rupees”, the words “ten thousand rupees”
shall be substituted.

10. In section 52 of the principal Act, for the words “two years and to fine”, the
words “three years and fine” shall be substituted.

11. In sub-section (1) of section 53 of the principal Act, for the words “three
thousand”, the words “ten thousand” shall be substituted.

12. In section 54 of the principal Act, for the words “five thousand”, the words
“twenty thousand” shall be substituted.






